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The saying “a baker’s dozen” refers to the number 13. It originated in England in the 13th century when 
all the king’s men required bakers to sell their goods by the dozen with a specific minimum weight or 
suffer a fine and perhaps worse. 

So, savvy bakers loaded another loaf on the pan to ban the man.

Earlier this week, I weighed in on the astounding rise of gold on our monthly commodities podcast for 
Kitco.com, now in its 10th season. Our usual alliterative title was: “Gold Has Gone on a Gallop” 
(Mercenary Musings Radio, September 3, 2019). And today, I tell you why.

Bullion was $1270 per ounce on May 21 and is $1520 per ounce as I write this missive. Folks, that’s a 
20% gain in three and a half months! It can be argued that gold has run up too far too fast and is overdue 
to test downside resistance. I agree with that assessment but at this juncture, why don’t we just sit back 
and enjoy the ride?

Here’s the year-to-date chart illustrating that 2019’s gains have occurred entirely during the late spring 
and summer:
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The impressive uptick has come mostly during the traditional summer doldrums, a season in which the 
gold price usually founders and sometimes reaches its yearly low. 

Below is a normalized record of the yearly gold price composited for the past 23 years; each month is 
represented by about 21 days of trading. Note in particular the downturn to flat market for gold from the 
beginning of June (day 106) thru late August (day 169). That’s the usual summertime blues:    

My baker’s dozen of reasons why gold has made an unprecedented move to the upside this summer is as 
follows:

1. Lowest interest rates since 2016; inverted yield curve for US treasuries; negative rates in EU.

2. Ever-increasing world government debt at $63 trillion; $15 trillion at negative interest rates.

3. Central bank bullion buying, especially by 2nd and 3rd World countries.

4. Ongoing trade disputes between the US and China and also the US and the EU.

5. A slowing world economy, especially in China and attributable to its trade war with the US.

6. Renewed European Union economic stimulus that includes buyback of its own bonds.

7. Major banks and other financial institutions long speculations on the gold price.

8. Increased holdings of paper gold in ETFs, now at nearly 2500 tonnes and highest since 2016.

9. Ongoing devaluation of all the world’s fiat currencies.

10. Long-lived gold bear market; 6.5 years since the price crash from $1680 to as low as $1050.

11. Geopolitical turmoil: China-Hong Kong; Iran-Venezuela sanctions; UK-EU over Brexit. 

12. Fears of an imminent world recession stoked by mainstream media sensationalism.

13. Increasing demand for physical gold by private hoarders.



I can summarize my list of reasons for gold’s recent run up in one succinct paragraph:

Gold is money. It has filled that role over the entire course of human history. Gold is the world’s only 
safe haven and insurance policy against financial calamity and economic collapse. Smart money hoards 
gold to preserve its wealth.

Remember the golden rule: He who has the gold makes the rules.

  
Ciao for now,

Mickey Fulp
Mercenary Geologist

Acknowledgment: Lukas Smith is the research assistant for MercenaryGeologist.com.

The Mercenary Geologist Michael S. “Mickey” Fulp is a Certified Professional Geologist with a 
B.Sc. in Earth Sciences with honor from the University of Tulsa, and M.Sc. in Geology from the 
University of New Mexico. Mickey has 40 years of experience as an exploration geologist and analyst 
searching for economic deposits of base and precious metals, industrial minerals, uranium, coal, oil and 
gas, and water in North and South America, Europe, and Asia.

Mickey worked for junior explorers, major mining companies, private companies, and investors as a 
consulting economic geologist for over 20 years, specializing in geological mapping, property evaluation, 
and business development.  In addition to Mickey’s professional credentials and experience, he is high-
altitude proficient, and is bilingual in English and Spanish. From 2003 to 2006, he made four outcrop ore 
discoveries in Peru, Nevada, Chile, and British Columbia.  

Mickey is well-known and highly respected throughout the mining and exploration community due to his 
ongoing work as an analyst, writer, and speaker. 
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Disclaimer and Notice: I am not a certified financial analyst, broker, or professional qualified to offer 
investment advice. Nothing in any report, commentary, this website, interview, and other content 
constitutes or can be construed as investment advice or an offer or solicitation or advice to buy or sell 
stock or any asset or investment. All of my presentations should be considered an opinion and my 
opinions may be based upon information obtained from research of public documents and content 
available on the company’s website, regulatory filings, various stock exchange websites, and stock 
information services, through discussions with company representatives, agents, other professionals and 
investors, and field visits. My opinions are based upon information believed to be accurate and reliable, 
but my opinions are not guaranteed or implied to be so. The opinions presented may not be complete or 
correct; all information is provided without any legal responsibility or obligation to provide future 
updates. I accept no responsibility and no liability, whatsoever, for any direct, indirect, special, punitive, 
or consequential damages or loss arising from the use of my opinions or information. The information 
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contained in a report, commentary, this website, interview, and other content is subject to change without 
notice, may become outdated, and may not be updated. A report, commentary, this website, interview, 
and other content reflect my personal opinions and views and nothing more. All content of this website is 
subject to international copyright protection and no part or portion of this website, report, commentary, 
interview, and other content may be altered, reproduced, copied, emailed, faxed, or distributed in any 
form without the express written consent of Michael S. (Mickey) Fulp, MercenaryGeologist.com LLC.
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